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Ellen Foster Kaye Gibbons 2012-01-01 Having suffered abuse and
misfortune for much of her life, a young child searches for a better life
and finally gets a break in the home of a loving woman with several
foster children.
On a Sunbeam Tillie Walden 2018-10-02 “Tillie Walden is the future of
comics, and On a Sunbeam is her best work yet. It’s a ‘space’ story unlike
any you’ve ever read, with a rich, lived-in universe of complex
characters.” —Brian K. Vaughan, Saga and Paper Girls Two timelines.
Second chances. One love. A ragtag crew travels to the deepest reaches
of space, rebuilding beautiful, broken structures to piece the past
together. Two girls meet in boarding school and fall deeply in love—only
to learn the pain of loss. With interwoven timelines and stunning art,
award-winning graphic novelist Tillie Walden creates an inventive world,
breathtaking romance, and an epic quest for love. LA Times Festival of
Books 2018 Book Prize Winner, Graphic Novel/Comics A Publisher's
Weekly Best Book of 2018 One of The Washington Post's "10 Best
Graphic Novels of 2018" A School Library Journal Best Book of 2018 A
YALSA Top Ten Great Graphic Novel A 2019 Hugo Award Nominee, Best
Graphic Story A Harvey Award Nominee, Book of the Year A Harvey
Award Nominee, Best Children's or Young Adult Book
Agewise Margaret Morganroth Gullette 2011-03-15 Let’s face it: almost
everyone fears growing older. We worry about losing our looks, our
health, our jobs, our self-esteem—and being supplanted in work and love
by younger people. It feels like the natural, inevitable consequence of the
passing years, But what if it’s not? What if nearly everything that we
think of as the “natural” process of aging is anything but? In Agewise,
renowned cultural critic Margaret Morganroth Gullette reveals that
much of what we dread about aging is actually the result of
ageism—which we can, and should, battle as strongly as we do racism,
sexism, and other forms of bigotry. Drawing on provocative and under-
reported evidence from biomedicine, literature, economics, and personal
stories, Gullette probes the ageism thatdrives discontent with our bodies,
our selves, and our accomplishments—and makes us easy prey for
marketers who want to sell us an illusory vision of youthful perfection.
Even worse, rampant ageism causes society to discount, and at times
completely discard, the wisdom and experience acquired by people over
the course of adulthood. The costs—both collective and personal—of this
culture of decline are almost incalculable, diminishing our workforce,
robbing younger people of hope for a decent later life, and eroding the
satisfactions and sense of productivity that should animate our later
years. Once we open our eyes to the pervasiveness of ageism, however,
we can begin to fight it—and Gullette lays out ambitious plans for the
whole life course, from teaching children anti-ageism to fortifying the
social safety nets, and thus finally making possible the real pleasures and
opportunities promised by the new longevity. A bracing, controversial
call to arms, Agewise will surprise, enlighten, and, perhaps most
important, bring hope to readers of all ages.
Bolder Dominique Afacan 2019-09-17 Bolder is on a mission to change
perceptions about growing older. Ageing is a constant for all of us, every
minute, every hour, every day. And ... gasp, it can be fun. This book
captures a journey to find people aged 70 and older who are still
creating, inspiring, or working, and who make old age look like a great
place to be. One of the stories features a woman who fell in love and
married aged 82. Another features a man who swims a mile in the
Mediterranean Sea every morning, aged 85. All of the interviewees
featured are engaged with and excited by the world around them. And so
many of them cite the happiest age of their lives as now, not then.
Our Wisdom Years Charles Garfield 2020-06-02 Psychologist and best-
selling author Charles Garfield shares an uplifting vision as he takes us
on a journey of a lifetime. Some of the most profound growth of our lives
can happen in the home stretch, the years after age sixty or so. It’s a
time when we can finally crystallize the meaning of what we’ve been and
done and fully expand into the self we’ve always intended to be. But, says
psychologist Charles Garfield, that can only happen if we first loosen the
grip of the life we’ve led so far, the one that’s been focused
outwardly—on activity, achievement, and the idea of success—and let our
souls lead the way. In Our Wisdom Years, Dr. Garfield skillfully and
practically guides readers through nine tasks that can transform the
struggles of aging, bringing fulfillment, joy, and serenity. Drawing on the
understandings that come from both his work as acclaimed “success

guru” in the 1980s and the truths distilled from volunteering with those
at the end of life, Garfield offers a fresh, uplifting vision of the wholeness
that awaits us. Dr. Garfield shares how we can gracefully let go of the
younger selves we’ve been and walk through the opening that keeps
beckoning toward this soul-driven version of later life. He encourages us
to take the risk of being fully alive as our years pass. This is no small
task—aging is not for the faint of heart! The beautiful paradox of growing
older is that none of the gifts of age are available without the kind of loss
that forces us to confront mortality in a way we can’t deny. In the face of
loss, we’re changed and expanded by truths that come from the heart,
not the mind. We learn that we’re more than our bodies, part of
something much larger than we are, and that love and kindness matter
most of all.
Health at Older Ages David M. Cutler 2009-05-15 Americans are living
longer—and staying healthier longer—than ever before. Despite the rapid
disappearance of pensions and health care benefits for retirees, older
people are healthier and better off than they were twenty years ago. In
Health at Older Ages, a distinguished team of economists analyzes the
foundations of disability decline, quantifies this phenomenon in economic
terms, and proposes what might be done to accelerate future
improvements in the health of our most elderly populations. This
breakthrough volume argues that educational attainment, high
socioeconomic status, an older retirement age, and accessible medical
care have improved the health and quality of life of seniors. Along the
way, it outlines the economic benefits of disability decline, such as an
increased rate of seniors in the workplace, relief for the healthcare
system and care-giving families, and reduced medical expenses for the
elderly themselves. Health at Older Ages will be an essential contribution
to the debate about meeting the medical needs of an aging nation.
Insights in the Economics of Aging David A. Wise 2017-03-20 The
fraction of the population over age sixty-five in many developed countries
is projected to rise, in some cases sharply, in coming decades. This has
drawn growing interest to research on the health and economic
circumstances of individuals as they age. Many individuals are retiring
from paid work, yet they are living longer than ever. Their well-being is
shaped by their past decisions such as their saving behavior, as well as
by current and future economic conditions, health status, medical
innovations, and a rapidly evolving landscape of policy incentives and
supports. The contributions to Insights in the Economics of Aging
uncover how financial, physical, and emotional well-being are integrally
related. The authors consider the interactions between financial
circumstances in later life, such as household savings and home
ownership, physical circumstances such as health and disability, and
emotional well-being, including happiness and mental health.
Aging Faithfully Alice Fryling 2021-12-07 Would you like to grow in
life-giving ways as you age? Do you have the courage to let go of former
ways of thinking to receive God’s love and life in new ways? As we age,
we experience the loss of physical stamina, independence, and career
fulfillment. Yet within each of these losses is a holy invitation to grow.
God calls us to let go of our need for accomplishment and embrace the
gift of fruitfulness so that we might be transformed in this final season of
our lives. In Aging Faithfully, spiritual director Alice Fryling offers
comfort and encouragement about growing older as she explores how to
navigate: The journey of retirement Lifestyle changes New limitations
New opportunities that come with aging well In this season of life, we
are invited to hold both grief and hope, to acknowledge ways of thinking
that no longer represent who we are, and to receive peace in the midst of
our fears. We all age differently, and God calls each of us to new spiritual
birth as we mature and deepen our faith. When we embrace the aging
process, we grow closer to God and experience his grace as he renews us
from within through his Holy Spirit. Whether you are approaching the
beginning, middle, or end of your senior years, you are invited. Come and
be transformed. Aging Faithfully includes questions for group discussion
and suggestions for personal meditation
The Gift of the Magi O. Henry 2021-12-22 "The Gift of the Magi" is a
short story by O. Henry first published in 1905. The story tells of a young
husband and wife and how they deal with the challenge of buying secret
Christmas gifts for each other with very little money. As a sentimental
story with a moral lesson about gift-giving, it has been popular for
adaptation, especially for presentation at Christmas time.
Silver Sparks Meg Selig 2020-08-24
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Older, Wiser, Shorter Jane Seskin 2024-05-24 OWS is an intimate
collection of 83 poems from Jane Seskin, a working psychotherapist and
author. Seskin, authentic, funny, insightful, quirky and heartfelt,
acknowledges the disappointments, physical vulnerability and emotional
loss taking place in her senior years. She is able to discover within
herself a solid sense of power, resilience and new-found joys through her
struggles to acknowledge, accommodate and accept her aging. Seskin's
ability to make the very personal universal, will resonate with readers
seeking to discover new ways to honor the past, celebrate the present
and welcome the future. A Reading Guide to the poems will inspire
further reflection and discussion for book and women's groups.
Growing Older and Wiser Nathan Billig 1993-01-01 Older adults are
more diverse biologically, socially, and psychologically than any other
age group. This guide to understanding the mental health of older people
reveals how to cope with the normal aging process and see its potentially
positive aspects while dealing with its problems.
Coming to Age Carolyn Hopley 2020-04-14 This exquisitely giftable
anthology of poems about age and aging reveals the wisdom of
trailblazing writers who found power and growth later in life. At eighty-
two, the novelist Penelope Lively wrote: "Our experience is one unknown
to most of humanity, over time. We are the pioneers." Coming to Age is a
collection of dispatches from the great poet-pioneers who have been
fortunate enough to live into their later years. Those later years can be
many things: a time of harvesting, of gathering together the various
strands of the past and weaving them into a rich fabric. They can also be
a new beginning, an exploration of the unknown. We speak of "growing
old." And indeed, as we too often forget, aging is growing, growing into a
new stage of life, one that can be a fulfillment of all that has come
before. To everything there is a season. Poetry speaks to them all. Just as
we read newspapers for news of the world, we read poetry for news of
ourselves. Poets, particularly those who have lived and written into old
age, have much to tell us. Bringing together a range of voices both
present and past, from Emily Dickinson and W. H. Auden to Louise Gluck
and Li-Young Lee, Coming to Age reveals new truths, offers spiritual
sustenance, and reminds us of what we already know but may have
forgotten, illuminating the profound beauty and significance of
commonplace moments that become more precious and radiant as we
grow older.
From Age-Ing to Sage-Ing Zalman Schachter-Shalomi 2014-06-03 Over
two decades ago, beloved and respected rabbi Zalman Schachter-
Shalomi felt an uneasiness. He was growing older, and fears about death
and infirmity were haunting him. So he decided to embark on mission to
get to the bottom of his fears. Through a series of events that included a
vision quest in a secluded cabin and studying with Sufi masters, Buddhist
teachers and Native-American shamans, Reb Zalman found a way to turn
aging into the most meangful and joyous time in his life. In this inspiring
and informative guide, Reb Zalman shares his wisdom and experience
with readers. He shows readers how to create an aging process for
themselves that is full of adventure, passion, mystery, and fulfillment,
rather than anxiety. Using scientific research--both neurological and
psychological-- Reb Zalman offers techniques that will expand horizons
beyond the narrow view of "the present" into a grand and enduring
eternity. By harnessing the power of the spirit, as well as explaining
exactly how to become a sage in their own community, he gives readers a
helpful and moving way to use their own experiences to nurture, heal,
and perhaps even save a younger generation from the prison of how we
typically regard aging. In this updated version of his popular book, Reb
Zalman has added a brand new introductory chapter that provides
insight into the shifts that have taken place in our culture since the first
edition of this book came out in the 1990s. Reb Zalman speaks candidly
about the role the 78 million (now aging) Baby Boomers are currently
playing in how we think about aging. He provides new inspiring ideas
about the importance of an elder's role in shaping society, and explains
how elders can embrace the power they have to provide value and
wisdom to those around them. Additionally he has added a concluding
chapter in which he shares his own experience with aging and the time
he calls "The December Years."
Couples of the Old Testament Dale Larsen 2011-10-17 The Old
Testament tells the stories of fascinating men and women in relationship:
couples who overcome all obstacles to be together, in-laws who can’t
stand each other, and a husband who takes back his wife when she
becomes a prostitute. This nine-session LifeGuide® Bible Study helps
you learn important lessons about marriage, God, and yourself.
Older, Wiser, Sexier (for women) Bev Williams 2016-09-08 'Never eat
healthy food. We so need all the preservatives we can get.' The hilarious

Spring Chicken greeting card range has brought wry smiles to the faces
of millions. Older, Wiser, Sexier brings together the best of the cheeky
but charming cartoons books to create the perfect gift for that person in
your life who may be getting on a bit but certainly isn't past it.
Getting Older, Growing Wiser Carol Ann Morrow 2014-10-07 We are all
aging. We can view this situation as fraught with danger and decline, or
as full of promise and possibility, claims the author.
Living with Purpose in a Worn-out Body Missy Buchanan 2008 Birthed
out of real-life experience, Living with Purpose in a Worn-out Body is a
big dose of authentic spiritual encouragement for frail elderly who
struggle to find purpose at the end of their lives. These devotionals
addressed to God raise in prayer the many concerns of the frail elderly
and provide opportunities to reminisce and reflect on their blessings.
Each Devotional Offers the Following: Easy-to-reead print, Reader-
friendly format, Comfortable, nonacademic language, A first-person
address to God, Brief supporting scriptures form the New and Old
Testaments. Living with Purpose in a Worn-out Body is a wonderful
collection of devotions that speaks to the issues and concerns faced by
the frail in their everyday lives. In simple yet powerful language, this
book offers hope and encouragement for the frail as they seek the
reassurance that God is always with them. Book jacket.
Growing Older & Wiser Dale Larsen 2011-10-18 Age brings many gifts
and opportunities for continued growth. In this nine-session LifeGuide®
Bible Study, Dale and Sandy Larsen help you discover the Bible's
perspective on aging. You'll discover how God can effectively and
powerfully use those who have grown wiser with the passing years.
Fierce with Age Carol Orsborn 2013-05-07 In her breakthrough
generational memoir, Boomer expert Carol Orsborn relates the ups and
downs of a tumultuous year spent facing, busting, and ultimately
triumphing over the stereotypes of growing old. Along the way, she
nurtures a love-starved friend through a doomed affair with a younger
man, wrestles with the meaning of an exploding fish, and regains her
passion for life at the side of her squirrel-crazed dog, Lucky. The
message is as deep as it is engaging. In Carol’s own words, “Plummet
into aging, stare mortality in the eye, surrender everything and what else
is there left to fear? The way is perilous, danger on all sides. But we can
be part of a generation no longer afraid of age. We are becoming,
instead, a generation fierce with age.”
Lots of Candles, Plenty of Cake Anna Quindlen 2012-04-24
“[Quindlen] serves up generous portions of her wise, commonsensical,
irresistibly quotable take on life.”—NPR This edition includes an
exclusive conversation between Meryl Streep and Anna Quindlen. In this
irresistible memoir, Anna Quindlen writes about a woman’s life, from
childhood memories to manic motherhood to middle age.
Considering—and celebrating—everything from marriage, girlfriends,
our mothers, parenting, faith, loss, to all the stuff in our closets, and
more, Quindlen says for us here what we may wish we could have said
ourselves. As she did in her beloved New York Times columns, and in A
Short Guide to a Happy Life, Quindlen uses her past, present, and future
to explore what matters most to women at different ages. Quindlen talks
about: Marriage: “A safety net of small white lies can be the bedrock of a
successful marriage. You wouldn’t believe how cheaply I can do a kitchen
renovation.” Girlfriends: “Ask any woman how she makes it through the
day, and she may mention her calendar, her to-do lists, her babysitter.
But if you push her on how she really makes it through her day, she will
mention her girlfriends. ” Our bodies: “I’ve finally recognized my body
for what it is: a personality-delivery system, designed expressly to carry
my character from place to place, now and in the years to come.”
Parenting: “Being a parent is not transactional. We do not get what we
give. It is the ultimate pay-it-forward endeavor: We are good parents not
so they will be loving enough to stay with us but so they will be strong
enough to leave us.” Candid, funny, and moving, Lots of Candles, Plenty
of Cake is filled with the sharp insights and revealing observations that
have long confirmed Quindlen’s status as America’s laureate of real life.
Still With It! Peter Buckman 2019-09-17 A heartfelt and humorous A to Z
companion to growing older, filled with the unfiltered opinions and
preoccupations of seniors today. When do we become “senior?” At age
sixty? At retirement? Or the moment we can’t do something that was
previously simple? While there are endless books on “staying young,”
there are precious few on embracing your age. Enter brilliant new
aphorist Peter Buckman! In this appealing guide, Buckman distills over
200 A-to-Z topics into sage wisdom, such as: “Secrets are not all that safe
when we grow forgetful about who we’re not supposed to share them
with.” And, “Respect should be accorded us for our sheer survival, if not
for our achievements!” Wry and revealing, Still With It! thoroughly
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examines the preoccupations of today’s seniors, and encourages readers
of all ages to view elders in a brighter light: not just older, but also most
certainly wiser. “An A to Z of advice, confession, wisdom, humor,
compassion, and self-mockery. Keep it bedside and read its contents in
the mornings before facing yet another day of aging.” —Sir Patrick
Stewart
The First Book of Moses, Called Genesis 1999 Hailed as "the most
radical repackaging of the Bible since Gutenberg", these Pocket Canons
give an up-close look at each book of the Bible.
Older, Wiser... Sexier (Women) Bev Williams 2012-01-01 "Never eat
healthy food. We so need all the preservatives we can get."--P.[4] of
cover.
Stupid Things I Won't Do When I Get Old Steven Petrow 2021-06-29 For
fans of David Sedaris and Nora Ephron, a humorous, irreverent, and
poignant look at the gifts, stereotypes, and inevitable challenges of
aging, based on award-winning journalist Steven Petrow's wildly popular
New York Times essay, "Things I'll Do Differently When I Get Old." Soon
after his 50th birthday, Petrow began assembling a list of “things I won’t
do when I get old”—mostly a catalog of all the things he thought his then
70-something year old parents were doing wrong. That list, which
included “You won’t have to shout at me that I’m deaf,” and “I won’t
blame the family dog for my incontinence,” became the basis of this
rousing collection of do’s and don’ts, wills and won’ts that is equal parts
hilarious, honest, and practical. The fact is, we don’t want to age the way
previous generations did. “Old people” hoard. They bore relatives—and
strangers alike—with tales of their aches and pains. They insist on
driving long after they’ve become a danger to others (and themselves).
They eat dinner at 4pm. They swear they don’t need a cane or walker
(and guess what happens next). They never, ever apologize. But there is
another way... In Stupid Things I Won’t Do When I Get Old, Petrow
candidly addresses the fears, frustrations, and stereotypes that
accompany aging. He offers a blueprint for the new old age, and an
understanding that aging and illness are not the same. As he writes, “I
meant the list to serve as a pointed reminder—to me—to make different
choices when I eventually cross the threshold to ‘old.’” Getting older is a
privilege. This essential guide reveals how to do it with grace, wisdom,
humor, and hope. And without hoarding. Praise for Stupid Things I Won't
Do When I Get Old: “Unbelievably witty and relatable, I alternated
bursting into laughter and placing my hand over my face in horror
thinking, Oh my God, is that me? I often say, at this age we have
something young people can never have…wisdom. My dear friend,
Steven Petrow, has wisdom to share in this honest, funny, wry guide to
keep us young at heart, without desperately hanging onto our youth. I
am buying this book for all of my friends!” —Suzanne Somers, New York
Times bestselling author of A New Way to Age “Stupid Things I Won’t Do
When I Get Old is an irreverent, funny, honest look at aging and all the
things we take for granted as normal parts of aging. They don’t need to
be. If you struggle with getting older and want to find a fresh perspective
on lessons learned about what NOT to do as we age, and what TO do to
stay young in heart, spirit, mind and body, read this book.” —Mark
Hyman, MD, #1 New York Times bestseller author of The Blood Sugar
Solution 10-Day Detox Diet, and Head of Strategy and Innovation at the
Cleveland Clinic Center for Functional Medicine. “Steven Petrow
resolved to do things differently than his parents had when he gets old
because he wished they’d been able to enjoy life more. His solution? He
created a list! In this book, he shares the secrets to living a full life
regardless of our age. It's all about the decisions we make every day. My
advice in a nutshell: Read this book and keep it handy.” —“Dear Abby”
(Jeanne Phillips), nationally syndicated advice columnist “It’s never too
early to imagine what your life will look like as you age. And as I once
wrote, ‘We are not hostages to our fate.’ Petrow’s book will help you
plan, think, and redefine what it means to get older—and even laugh
while doing it.” —Andrew Weil, MD, New York Times bestselling author
of Spontaneous Healing and Healthy Aging: A Lifelong Guide to Your
Well-Being “Steven Petrow not only has a great attitude about life, he is
wise about how to live it. Like me, he says we should embrace our one
life 100% and not let a number—our age—get in the way of anything!
Steven’s book will help you rethink the word “aging” and approach this
next chapter with a positive and proactive attitude. Plus, this book is
fun!” —Denise Austin, renowned fitness expert, author, and columnist
“Steven’s writing feels like sitting with a friend—one who is unusually
gracious, warm and frank.” —Carolyn Hax, author of the nationally
syndicated advice column, Carolyn Hax Praise for Steven Petrow:
"Steven Petrow's Complete Gay & Lesbian Manners helps gays and
straights navigate the subtleties of the same-sex world." —People "Move

over, Emily Post! When it comes to etiquette for members of the gay,
lesbian, bisexual and transgender community—as well as their straight
friends, family members and coworkers--author and journalist Steven
Petrow is the authority." —TIME "What could've easily become a novelty
book has emerged as an exhaustively researched, essential resource
thanks to advice columnist and etiquette expert Steven Petrow." —The
Advocate "From having kids to planning funerals, Steven Petrow's
Complete Gay & Lesbian Manners has most facets of gay life covered.
Ms. Post would approve." —Entertainment Weekly "An indispensable
refresher course...on what's proper in modern...life." —Kirkus Reviews
Aging as a Spiritual Practice Lewis Richmond 2012-01-05 The
bestselling author of Work as a Spiritual Practice presents a new vision
of the aging process, awakening a spirit of fulfillment and
transformation. Everything changes. For Buddhist priest and meditation
teacher Lewis Richmond, this fundamental Buddhist tenet is the basis for
a new inner road map that emerges in the later years, charting an
understanding that can bring new possibilities, fresh beginnings, and a
wealth of appreciation and gratitude for the life journey itself. In Aging
as a Spiritual Practice, Richmond acknowledges the fear, anger, and
sorrow many people experience when they must confront the indignities
of their aging bodies and the unknowns associated with mortality. This
wise, compassionate book guides readers through the four key stages of
aging- such as "Lightning Strikes" (the moment we wake up to our
aging)-as well as the processes of adapting to change, letting go of who
we were, embracing who we are, and appreciating our unique life
chapters. Unlike many philosophical works on aging, however, this one
incorporates illuminating facts from scientific researchers, doctors, and
psychologists, as well as contemplative practices and guided meditations
on aging's various challenges and rewards. The tandem of maintaining a
healthy body and healthy relationships, infused with an active spiritual
life, is explored in rejuvenating detail. Breath by breath, moment by
moment, Richmond's teachings inspire limitless opportunities for a joy
that transcends age.
Growing Older & Wiser Dale Larsen 2005-07-07 Age brings many gifts
and opportunities for continued growth. In this nine-session LifeGuide®
Bible Study, Dale and Sandy Larsen help you discover the Bible's
perspective on aging. You'll discover how God can effectively and
powerfully use those who have grown wiser with the passing years.
Bolder and Wiser Sarah Dale 2013-11 Hit 50 yet? Sarah Dale is about
to. This impending event set her wondering about successful ageing,
what life looks like for women who have been there and done that, and
what adventures are to be had on the other side of 50. In this fascinating
and celebratory book, Sarah talks to 20 inspiring women who have not
only made it past 50, but are happy to be there. These open and honest
conversations, punctuated by Sarah's observations about her own
journey, reflect on friendship, work, health, creativity, marriage,
motherhood, money - and whether you should stop dyeing your hair.
Sarah Dale is a chartered psychologist and accredited coach. She
devised the Creating Focus programme and is the author of Keeping
Your Spirits Up. She was born in 1964...
Growing Old Elizabeth Marshall Thomas 2020-04-28 From the revered
author of the bestselling The Hidden Life of Dogs, a witty, engaging, life-
affirming account of the joy, strength, and wisdom that comes with age.
Elizabeth Marshall Thomas has spent a lifetime observing the natural
world, chronicling the customs of pre-contact hunter-gatherers and the
secret lives of deer and dogs. In this book, the capstone of her long
career, Thomas, now eighty-eight, turns her keen eye to her own life. The
result is an account of growing old that is at once funny and charming
and intimate and profound, both a memoir and a life-affirming map all of
us may follow to embrace our later years with grace and dignity. A
charmingly intimate account and a broad look at the social and historical
traditions related to aging, Growing Old explores a wide range of issues
connected with growing older, from stereotypes of the elderly as
burdensome to the methods of burial humans have used throughout
history to how to deal with a concerned neighbor who assumes you’re
buying cat food to eat for dinner. Written with the wit of Nora Ephron’s I
Feel Bad About My Neck and the lyrical beauty and serene wisdom of
When Breath Becomes Air, Growing Old is an expansive and deeply
personal paean to the beauty and the brevity of life that offers
understanding for everyone, regardless of age.
For Everyone Bible Study Guides Tom Wright 2009-07 A series of short,
question-based study guides based around the New Testament For
Everyone series. The series is intended to encourage groups to study the
Bible using the For Everyone model. Experienced Bible study writers
have selected excerpts and written questions for users. These have been
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reviewed, edited and approved by Tom Wright.
Growing, Older Joan Dye Gussow 2010 The author describes her life
after she loses her husband of forty years to cancer, describing her
surprising reaction to his death and how she found contentment in her
garden.
This Chair Rocks Ashton Applewhite 2020-08-11 Author, activist, and
TED speaker Ashton Applewhite has written a rousing manifesto calling
for an end to discrimination and prejudice on the basis of age. In our
youth obsessed culture, we’re bombarded by media images and
messages about the despairs and declines of our later years. Beauty and
pharmaceutical companies work overtime to convince people to purchase
products that will retain their youthful appearance and vitality. Wrinkles
are embarrassing. Gray hair should be colored and bald heads covered
with implants. Older minds and bodies are too frail to keep up with the
pace of the modern working world and olders should just step aside for
the new generation. Ashton Applewhite once held these beliefs too until
she realized where this prejudice comes from and the damage it does.
Lively, funny, and deeply researched, This Chair Rocks traces her
journey from apprehensive boomer to pro-aging radical, and in the
process debunks myth after myth about late life. Explaining the roots of
ageism in history and how it divides and debases, Applewhite examines
how ageist stereotypes cripple the way our brains and bodies function,
looks at ageism in the workplace and the bedroom, exposes the cost of
the all-American myth of independence, critiques the portrayal of elders
as burdens to society, describes what an all-age-friendly world would
look like, and offers a rousing call to action. It’s time to create a world of
age equality by making discrimination on the basis of age as
unacceptable as any other kind of bias. Whether you’re older or hoping
to get there, this book will shake you by the shoulders, cheer you up,
make you mad, and change the way you see the rest of your life. Age
pride! “Wow. This book totally rocks. It arrived on a day when I was in
deep confusion and sadness about my age. Everything about it, from my
invisibility to my neck. Within four or five wise, passionate pages, I had
found insight, illumination, and inspiration. I never use the word
empower, but this book has empowered me.” —Anne Lamott, New York
Times bestselling author
Gardening for a Lifetime Sydney Eddison 2011-01-01 A lifelong
gardener offers practical advice that will help transform gardening from
a daunting list of chores into a rewarding activity.
The Gift of Years Joan Chittister 2010 Looks at the many dimensions of
aging and considers the joys of this special stage of life as well as the
rewards of being open to new experiences and new relationships.
I Love Growing Older, But I'll Never Grow Old Dr. J. Ellsworth Kalas
2013-04-01 Growing older is a process. Growing old is a conclusion. If
you’re growing older you see some hope because you have perspective
and you keep learning. If you’ve grown old, you may cynically think that
times have never been as bad as they are now, and that they can only get
worse.” This book is about learning how to “make peace with where you
are right now.” It’s about learning from the past and then moving past it.
It’s about growing—personally, spiritually, and in our relationships with
God and with others. If we think properly about growing older we’ll
never have to grow old. A discussion guide is included.
The Granny Who Stands on Her Head Ann Richardson 2021-11-22
"Somewhere in the middle of my seventies, I realised that I liked being
old." So begins this set of engaging stories and thoughts on growing
older by someone with a vast range of life experience to share. Part
memoir and part reflection on the joys and challenges of modern life, this
book explores the nature of old age and how it compares to what came
before. The author argues that being older does not have to be feared.
Even better, it can be fun. This kaleidoscopic book offers a refreshing -
and often funny - look at a wide range of issues, Including the personal
awkwardness of a loss of memory, a new take on the nature of ambition,
and sex at the age of 90. It challenges head on many of the prevalent
myths and taboos surrounding old age. You may never look at old age in
the same way again.
Growing Older and Wiser Nathan Billig 1993-01-01 Older adults are
more diverse bilogically, socially and psychologically than any other age
group. It is easier to describe a typical two-year-old or 20-year-old than it
is a typical 75-year-old. Within the group called elderly, 65-year-olds are
clearly very different 100-year-olds.
An Essential Guide to Aging Well Katharine Bethell 2020 "This book
is a refreshingly honest self-help guide to aging well. It encourages
readers to dispel gloom or overcome denial around the subject of aging
and offers advice in a realistic, non-prescriptive format. Written in a
conversational style, An Essential Guide to Aging Well motivates its

readers to be curious about this time of life, and to design the best
possible version of it for themselves"--
Work as a Spiritual Practice Lewis Richmond 2000-02-01 A guide to
developing and maintaining a spiritual life on the job, drawn from the
teachings and practices of Buddhist tradition. Most people associate
Buddhism with developing calmness, kindness, and compassion through
meditation. Lewis Richmond's Work as a Spiritual Practice shows us
another aspect of Buddhism: the active, engaged side that allows us to
find creativity, inspiration, and accomplishment in our work lives. With
over forty spiritual exercises that can be practiced in the middle of a
busy workday, Work as a Spiritual Practice is based on the principle that
"regardless of your rank and title at work, you are always the chief
executive of your inner life." Drawn from the author's diverse
professional experience—as a Buddhist meditation teacher, business
executive, musician, and high-tech entrepreneur—Work as a Spiritual
Practice addresses a wide variety of on-the-job problems. Here you'll
learn how to: • perform spiritual practices while commuting to and from
work • meditate while sitting, walking, or standing—a minute at a time •
understand ambition, money, and power from a spiritual perspective
Work as a Spiritual Practice is an essential guide for anyone who wants
to bring his or her spiritual life and work life together.
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